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Scarves and wraps are the perfect canvases for experimenting with new stitches and practicing new
techniques. From well-respected Rowan Yarn designer Sarah Hatton with Sharon Brant as the technical
editor, Wraps, Shawls & Scarves to Knit offers over twenty-five easy-to-make and fun-to-wear designs that
explore a range of knitting techniques-from gorgeous textured and cabled stitches, to intricate openwork and
lace patterns, to interesting and appealing shaping. A gallery of designs features the garments photographed
in full color and includes a helpful and inspiring "How to Wear It" section, showcasing the myriad ways to
wrap your shawl, twist your neck warmer, or tie your scarf. Making these popular accessories even more
versatile so you can wear them over and over, and still keep them looking fresh!

Step-by-step instructions and close-up photography are given for all the techniques covered-from knitting in
the round, increasing and decreasing, making edgings, adding beading, and more. Plus, additional ideas and
tips for tweaking the designs expands the options for creating your own customized adaptations. All the
projects are knit with sumptuous Rowan yarn in a range of weights and types, so you can always throw on
one of your designs, no matter what the season. For innovative knitters of all levels, this book is both a
wonderful sourcebook of stunning designs and a handy reference to help you master the art of knitting.
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From reader reviews:

Richard Slawson:

As people who live in the particular modest era should be up-date about what going on or details even
knowledge to make these individuals keep up with the era that is certainly always change and move ahead.
Some of you maybe can update themselves by looking at books. It is a good choice for yourself but the
problems coming to anyone is you don't know what kind you should start with. This Scarves, Shrugs &
Shawls: 22 Knitted Designs with Their Special Techniques is our recommendation to cause you to keep up
with the world. Why, as this book serves what you want and wish in this era.

Jessie Lloyd:

Now a day people that Living in the era just where everything reachable by connect with the internet and the
resources inside it can be true or not involve people to be aware of each facts they get. How individuals to be
smart in getting any information nowadays? Of course the answer is reading a book. Studying a book can
help individuals out of this uncertainty Information particularly this Scarves, Shrugs & Shawls: 22 Knitted
Designs with Their Special Techniques book because book offers you rich information and knowledge. Of
course the knowledge in this book hundred pct guarantees there is no doubt in it everbody knows.

Alex Jose:

Playing with family within a park, coming to see the marine world or hanging out with close friends is thing
that usually you might have done when you have spare time, after that why you don't try issue that really
opposite from that. A single activity that make you not experience tired but still relaxing, trilling like on
roller coaster you already been ride on and with addition associated with. Even you love Scarves, Shrugs &
Shawls: 22 Knitted Designs with Their Special Techniques, you may enjoy both. It is great combination
right, you still would like to miss it? What kind of hangout type is it? Oh can happen its mind hangout guys.
What? Still don't have it, oh come on its called reading friends.

Sandra Birk:

The book untitled Scarves, Shrugs & Shawls: 22 Knitted Designs with Their Special Techniques contain a
lot of information on the item. The writer explains your ex idea with easy way. The language is very
straightforward all the people, so do not really worry, you can easy to read this. The book was authored by
famous author. The author provides you in the new era of literary works. You can read this book because you
can read on your smart phone, or device, so you can read the book in anywhere and anytime. If you want to
buy the e-book, you can available their official web-site in addition to order it. Have a nice learn.
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