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Analyzing how hacks are done, so as to stop them in the future

Reverse engineering is the process of analyzing hardware or software and understanding it, without having
access to the source code or design documents. Hackers are able to reverse engineer systems and exploit
what they find with scary results. Now the good guys can use the same tools to thwart these threats. Practical
Reverse Engineering goes under the hood of reverse engineering for security analysts, security engineers,
and system programmers, so they can learn how to use these same processes to stop hackers in their tracks.

The book covers x86, x64, and ARM (the first book to cover all three); Windows kernel-mode code rootkits
and drivers; virtual machine protection techniques; and much more. Best of all, it offers a systematic
approach to the material, with plenty of hands-on exercises and real-world examples.

Offers a systematic approach to understanding reverse engineering, with hands-on exercises and real-world●

examples
Covers x86, x64, and advanced RISC machine (ARM) architectures as well as deobfuscation and virtual●

machine protection techniques
Provides special coverage of Windows kernel-mode code (rootkits/drivers), a topic not often covered●

elsewhere, and explains how to analyze drivers step by step
Demystifies topics that have a steep learning curve●

Includes a bonus chapter on reverse engineering tools●

Practical Reverse Engineering: Using x86, x64, ARM, Windows Kernel, and Reversing Tools provides
crucial, up-to-date guidance for a broad range of IT professionals.
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From reader reviews:

Shirley Demers:

Here thing why this specific Practical Reverse Engineering: x86, x64, ARM, Windows Kernel, Reversing
Tools, and Obfuscation are different and trusted to be yours. First of all studying a book is good but it
depends in the content than it which is the content is as yummy as food or not. Practical Reverse
Engineering: x86, x64, ARM, Windows Kernel, Reversing Tools, and Obfuscation giving you information
deeper as different ways, you can find any publication out there but there is no reserve that similar with
Practical Reverse Engineering: x86, x64, ARM, Windows Kernel, Reversing Tools, and Obfuscation. It
gives you thrill looking at journey, its open up your eyes about the thing which happened in the world which
is maybe can be happened around you. It is easy to bring everywhere like in park, café, or even in your
method home by train. Should you be having difficulties in bringing the branded book maybe the form of
Practical Reverse Engineering: x86, x64, ARM, Windows Kernel, Reversing Tools, and Obfuscation in e-
book can be your alternate.

Raymond McMillion:

The particular book Practical Reverse Engineering: x86, x64, ARM, Windows Kernel, Reversing Tools, and
Obfuscation has a lot of knowledge on it. So when you read this book you can get a lot of help. The book
was compiled by the very famous author. The author makes some research previous to write this book. This
specific book very easy to read you may get the point easily after scanning this book.

David Johnston:

Practical Reverse Engineering: x86, x64, ARM, Windows Kernel, Reversing Tools, and Obfuscation can be
one of your basic books that are good idea. Most of us recommend that straight away because this
publication has good vocabulary that could increase your knowledge in words, easy to understand, bit
entertaining however delivering the information. The article writer giving his/her effort to set every word
into delight arrangement in writing Practical Reverse Engineering: x86, x64, ARM, Windows Kernel,
Reversing Tools, and Obfuscation but doesn't forget the main stage, giving the reader the hottest as well as
based confirm resource information that maybe you can be certainly one of it. This great information can
easily drawn you into new stage of crucial pondering.

Alexander Ray:

As a scholar exactly feel bored for you to reading. If their teacher questioned them to go to the library in
order to make summary for some guide, they are complained. Just tiny students that has reading's spirit or
real their pastime. They just do what the teacher want, like asked to the library. They go to right now there
but nothing reading very seriously. Any students feel that looking at is not important, boring and can't see
colorful pictures on there. Yeah, it is being complicated. Book is very important in your case. As we know
that on this period, many ways to get whatever you want. Likewise word says, many ways to reach Chinese's



country. Therefore , this Practical Reverse Engineering: x86, x64, ARM, Windows Kernel, Reversing Tools,
and Obfuscation can make you really feel more interested to read.
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