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The daughter of the vicar at St. Luke's Church in the village of Hodnet, Mary Cholmondeley spent much of
the first thirty years of her life taking care of her sickly mother. Members of her family were involved in the
literary world, notably her uncle Reginald Cholmondeley who was a friend of the American novelist, Mark
Twain.
Growing up, Mary Cholmondeley liked to tell stories to her siblings and turned to writing fiction as an
escape from the monotony of her daily routine. Her diary showed that by the age of 18 she was already
convinced she would never marry, lacking, she believed, the looks and the charms necessary to attract a
suitable mate. Novelist, Rhoda Broughton introduced her to George Bentley of Richard Bentley and Son,
prominent London book publishers who had published some of the early works of Charles Dickens.
Cholmondeley's first book was published under the title, Her Evil Genius and shortly thereafter in 1886, her
second work The Danvers Jewels earned her a small, but respectable following. In 1896 her family moved to
the village of Condover temporarily before settling permanently in London where she wrote the 1899
satirical novel, Red Pottage for which she is best remembered.
Although shy because of her isolated background, she became friends with some of the well know literary
figures of the time and in addition to more than a dozen novels, Cholmondeley wrote essays, articles and
short stories.
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From reader reviews:

Herman Lewis:

Have you spare time for the day? What do you do when you have a lot more or little spare time? Yep, you
can choose the suitable activity regarding spend your time. Any person spent all their spare time to take a
stroll, shopping, or went to the Mall. How about open or even read a book eligible Diana Tempest? Maybe it
is being best activity for you. You realize beside you can spend your time with your favorite's book, you can
smarter than before. Do you agree with its opinion or you have various other opinion?

Carlos Wesley:

Reading a e-book can be one of a lot of pastime that everyone in the world loves. Do you like reading book
therefore. There are a lot of reasons why people like it. First reading a guide will give you a lot of new
information. When you read a reserve you will get new information since book is one of a number of ways to
share the information or their idea. Second, looking at a book will make you more imaginative. When you
studying a book especially tale fantasy book the author will bring that you imagine the story how the
personas do it anything. Third, you are able to share your knowledge to other people. When you read this
Diana Tempest, you can tells your family, friends in addition to soon about yours e-book. Your knowledge
can inspire others, make them reading a reserve.

Nicholas Valles:

Many people spending their time by playing outside along with friends, fun activity with family or just
watching TV all day long. You can have new activity to shell out your whole day by reading through a book.
Ugh, you think reading a book really can hard because you have to take the book everywhere? It alright you
can have the e-book, delivering everywhere you want in your Mobile phone. Like Diana Tempest which is
getting the e-book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's notice.

Janice Garcia:

As a scholar exactly feel bored for you to reading. If their teacher expected them to go to the library in order
to make summary for some book, they are complained. Just tiny students that has reading's heart or real their
passion. They just do what the teacher want, like asked to the library. They go to presently there but nothing
reading really. Any students feel that looking at is not important, boring and can't see colorful photographs
on there. Yeah, it is to be complicated. Book is very important in your case. As we know that on this era,
many ways to get whatever we really wish for. Likewise word says, ways to reach Chinese's country. So ,
this Diana Tempest can make you sense more interested to read.
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