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The first novel written by Booker finalist Tom McCarthy—acclaimed author of Remainder and C—Men in
Space is set in a Central Europe rapidly fragmenting after the fall of communism. It follows an oddball
cast—dissolute bohemians, political refugees, a football referee, a disorientated police agent, and a stranded
astronaut—as they chase a stolen painting from Sofia to Prague and onward. Planting the themes that
McCarthy’s later works develop, here McCarthy questions the meaning of all kinds of space—physical,
political, emotional, and metaphysical—as reflected in the characters’ various disconnections. What emerges
is a vision of humanity adrift in history, and a world in a state of disintegration.

With an afterword by Simon Critchley, author of The Book of Dead Philosophers
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From reader reviews:

Ann Tuttle:

Book is to be different for each grade. Book for children right up until adult are different content. To be sure
that book is very important normally. The book Men in Space has been making you to know about other
information and of course you can take more information. It is quite advantages for you. The publication
Men in Space is not only giving you a lot more new information but also for being your friend when you
sense bored. You can spend your personal spend time to read your e-book. Try to make relationship while
using book Men in Space. You never truly feel lose out for everything should you read some books.

Fredrick Alfred:

Information is provisions for anyone to get better life, information these days can get by anyone on
everywhere. The information can be a information or any news even a huge concern. What people must be
consider whenever those information which is from the former life are challenging be find than now could be
taking seriously which one would work to believe or which one the actual resource are convinced. If you get
the unstable resource then you obtain it as your main information you will have huge disadvantage for you.
All of those possibilities will not happen throughout you if you take Men in Space as your daily resource
information.

Edna Barnett:

Reading a publication can be one of a lot of pastime that everyone in the world really likes. Do you like
reading book so. There are a lot of reasons why people enjoyed. First reading a book will give you a lot of
new data. When you read a guide you will get new information mainly because book is one of a number of
ways to share the information or their idea. Second, looking at a book will make an individual more
imaginative. When you reading a book especially tale fantasy book the author will bring someone to imagine
the story how the character types do it anything. Third, you may share your knowledge to other people.
When you read this Men in Space, you can tells your family, friends in addition to soon about yours book.
Your knowledge can inspire the others, make them reading a publication.

Eva Lynch:

Are you kind of occupied person, only have 10 or maybe 15 minute in your time to upgrading your mind
talent or thinking skill possibly analytical thinking? Then you are having problem with the book as compared
to can satisfy your limited time to read it because pretty much everything time you only find book that need
more time to be go through. Men in Space can be your answer mainly because it can be read by you who
have those short time problems.
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