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The only thing more dangerous than passion is the truth. Former Marine and new Sheriff’s Deputy Cade
Evigan is hanging onto his damaged soul—and his personal code—by a thread. His current mission? Weed
out a violent motorcycle crew from a small mountain town. The problem? Katrina Killian, a woman standing
firmly on the other side of the law, smack in the middle of the gang he’s there to destroy. She may get under
his skin, but the sultry biker has criminal written all over her. So why can't he see her like any other convict?
For two years, Katrina has been a DEA agent hiding in plain sight amidst a pack of killers, working to put an
end to the gang that has terrorized her hometown. The last thing she needs is to fall in love with a man who
could blow her cover—and her heart—to pieces, but Cade’s become an addiction she can’t break. Unable to
risk either of their lives with the truth, she plays both ends against the middle to keep him safe. But lies can
only last so long, and Katrina’s time has just run out…
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From reader reviews:

Jessie Nathan:

In this 21st century, people become competitive in each way. By being competitive now, people have do
something to make these people survives, being in the middle of the crowded place and notice by means of
surrounding. One thing that oftentimes many people have underestimated the idea for a while is reading.
That's why, by reading a book your ability to survive improve then having chance to stand up than other is
high. For you who want to start reading any book, we give you that Convicted book as beginner and daily
reading book. Why, because this book is usually more than just a book.

Gary Forsyth:

The reason? Because this Convicted is an unordinary book that the inside of the publication waiting for you
to snap it but latter it will shock you with the secret that inside. Reading this book adjacent to it was fantastic
author who have write the book in such amazing way makes the content on the inside easier to understand,
entertaining technique but still convey the meaning entirely. So , it is good for you because of not hesitating
having this nowadays or you going to regret it. This amazing book will give you a lot of gains than the other
book get such as help improving your skill and your critical thinking approach. So , still want to postpone
having that book? If I have been you I will go to the publication store hurriedly.

Samuel Freeman:

On this era which is the greater man or who has ability in doing something more are more treasured than
other. Do you want to become certainly one of it? It is just simple solution to have that. What you need to do
is just spending your time almost no but quite enough to possess a look at some books. One of many books
in the top list in your reading list is Convicted. This book which is qualified as The Hungry Inclines can get
you closer in becoming precious person. By looking upwards and review this book you can get many
advantages.

Pat Thomas:

You can obtain this Convicted by visit the bookstore or Mall. Just viewing or reviewing it could to be your
solve problem if you get difficulties for ones knowledge. Kinds of this publication are various. Not only
simply by written or printed but additionally can you enjoy this book by e-book. In the modern era including
now, you just looking of your mobile phone and searching what your problem. Right now, choose your
personal ways to get more information about your e-book. It is most important to arrange yourself to make
your knowledge are still up-date. Let's try to choose appropriate ways for you.
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